CITY OF BRENTWOOD
BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE: 10/2/2014 PAGE: 1 OF 2
BID OPENING TIME: 10:15am
BID TITLE/DESCRIPTION: Earthen Materials
Brentwood Bldg
COMPANY NAME Supply Brentwood Material Fred Weber
CITY & STATE Brentwood Brentwood Maryland Heights
CONTACT 314-962-2102 314-968-0184
PHONE
FAX
EMAIL
Delivered Delivered Pick up Delivered
QTyY UNIT DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
3/4-inch Minus Rock $ 18.95 S 1240(|S 1650|S 4.25
1-inch Clean Rock S 19.50 S 16.10|S 1875|S$ 9.25
River Sand $ 19.50 S 12.80 (S 19.75 | no bid
Topsoil $ 29.50 S 24.00 no bid
Hardwood Mulch (Double Ground) S 23.00 S 21.00 no bid
Kiddie Cushion Mulch n/a S 32.00 no bid
Delivery Charge $30/load $0.00 $4.95
Fuel Delivery Surcharge / YD $0.00 $0.00 n/a
Pick up Charge $0.00 $0.00 n/a
2% yrly increase 2.5% yrly increase




CITY OF BRENTWOOD
BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE: 10/2/2014 PAGE: 2 OF 2
BID OPENING TIME: 10:15am
BID TITLE/DESCRIPTION: Earthen Materials

COMPANY NAME Breckenridge Landvatter
CITY & STATE Brentwood
CONTACT
PHONE
FAX
EMAIL
Qry UNIT DESCRIPTION PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
3/4-inch Minus Rock S 18.00 no bid
1-inch Clean Rock $ 23.75 S 20.00
River Sand S 15.40 S 12.00
Topsoil n/a no bid
Hardwood Mulch (Double Ground) n/a no bid
Kiddie Cushion Mulch n/a no bid
Delivery Charge $125/load no bid
Fuel Delivery Surcharge / YD $0.00 no bid
Pick up Charge $0.00 no bid




